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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST 

RF22-500 

 
We can confirm East Kent Hospitals University NHS Foundation Trust (EKHUFT) does not hold 
the information you have requested. Please refer to the responses in bold below. 
 
 
1i. How many people were treated for injuries relating to e-scooters at your hospitals’ A&E departments 
in each of the following years:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
1ii. In each of the following years, how many of the people treated for injuries relating to e-scooters had 
consumed alcohol:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
2i. How many people were treated for injuries relating to cycling at your hospitals’ A&E departments in 
each of the following years:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
2ii. In each of the following years, how many of the people treated for injuries relating to cycling had 
consumed alcohol:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
3i. How many people were treated for injuries relating to motorbikes at your hospitals’ A&E departments 
in each of the following years:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
3ii. In each of the following years, how many of the people treated for injuries relating to motorbikes had 
consumed alcohol:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  
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4. How many people were treated for head injuries relating to e-scooters at your hospitals’ A&E 
departments in each of the following years:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

  
5. How many people were treated for head injuries relating to cycling at your hospital’s A&E department 
in each of the following years:  
 

a. 2020  
b. 2021  
c. 2022 (up to and including 31st August)  

 
EKHUFT does not hold this information as we do not record incidents in this specific way.  We 

would be able to provide you with information recorded under Road Traffic Incidents but not 

broken down into the specific categories as requested.  

 

 

 

 

 
 

(ALL INFORMATION PROVIDED AS AT 28 SEPTEMBER 2022) 
 
 
 
 
 


