
 

 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST 

RF24-020 

Request: 

1. Number of births 2022-23  
2. Number of births 2021-22  
3. Number of births 2020-21  
4. Number of births 2019-20 

 
5. Number of inductions 2022-23  
6. Number of inductions 2021-22  
7. Number of inductions 2020-21  
8. Number of inductions 2019-20 

 
9. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2022-23  
10. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2021-22  
11. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2020-21  
12. Number of Datix mentioning delays in induction 2019-20 

 
13. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay of 2 hours or more 

between admission for induction and beginning of the process in 2022-23  
14. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay of 2 hours or more 

between admission for induction and beginning of the process in 2021-22  
15. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay of 2 hours or more 

between admission for induction and beginning of the process in 2020-21  
16. Number of “maternity red flag events” recorded in which there was a delay of 2 hours or more 

between admission for induction and beginning of the process in 2019-20  

 

Response: 

We can confirm East Kent Hospitals University NHS Foundation Trust (EKHUFT) holds the information 
you have requested. 

For questions one to four these are the numbers of livebirths using the MBRRACE definition.  Babies 
born at EKHUFT at 24+0 weeks gestation or higher or birthweight greater than or equal to 400g where 
gestation is unknown 

1. 6221 births 

2. 6188 births 

3. 6107 births 

4. 6386 births 

5. 2006 inductions  

6. 2160 inductions 

7. 2044 inductions  

8. 1911 inductions  

9. Three 

10.  One 



  

2 

11. Four 

12. Four 

13. 113 maternity red flags  

14. 137 maternity red flags 

15. Information not held. We only hold red flag data since June 2021  

16. Information not held. We only hold red flag data since June 2021 

 

(DATE OF RESPONSE: 24 JANUARY 2024) 

 


